
 

 

 
Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 1 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section A  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 8,778.00 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 12,540.39 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 11,147.40 

Hazmasters Inc. 8,445.09 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 8,894.82 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 10,109.40 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 16,502.40 

MWG Apparel Corporation 10,653.75 

River City Industrial Products 9,731.76 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 8,910.45 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 13,945.00 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 9,975.00 

Unisync Group Ltd. 12,913.35 

Vallen Canada 9,268.59 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 14,592.80 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 2 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section B  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 30,186.10 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 43,128.90 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 38,312.00 

Hazmasters Inc. 29,037.60 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 30,591.65 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 34,698.25 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 57,505.75 

MWG Apparel Corporation 36,625.00 

River City Industrial Products 33,466.50 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 30,639.95 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 46,918.20 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 34,305.70 

Unisync Group Ltd. 44,420.90 

Vallen Canada 31,871.00 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 45,320.50 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 3 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section C  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 7,285.74 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 9,646.00 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 9,434.20 

Hazmasters Inc. No bid submitted 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 8,684.72 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 9,386.50 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 14,433.70 

MWG Apparel Corporation 8,839.50 

River City Industrial Products 9,049.08 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 8,814.20 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 11,481.00 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 9,275.00 

Unisync Group Ltd. 9,937.38 

Vallen Canada 9,049.08 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 10,552.20 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 4 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section D  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 
15,831.00 

(partial bid) 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 17,992.00 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 17,579.50 

Hazmasters Inc. No bid submitted 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 
15,701.65 

(partial bid) 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 17,491.75 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 25,705.75 

MWG Apparel Corporation 
19,215.00 

(partial bid) 

River City Industrial Products 16,877.40 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 16,440.90 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 19,445.00 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 17,300.00 

Unisync Group Ltd. 19,431.45 

Vallen Canada 16,877.40 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 26,716.00 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 5 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section E  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 4,914.65 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 7,021.35 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 6,239.50 

Hazmasters Inc. 4,644.20 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 4,892.80 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 
4,288.25 

(partial bid) 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 8,794.50 

MWG Apparel Corporation 5,857.50 

River City Industrial Products 5,352.60 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 4,900.50 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 7,625.00 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 5,625.00 

Unisync Group Ltd. 7,231.15 

Vallen Canada 5,188.90 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 6,973.50 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 6 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section F  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 
5,803.60 

(partial bid) 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 8,775.00 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 8,359.70 

Hazmasters Inc. No bid submitted 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 
7,423.01 

(partial bid) 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 8,526.75 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 12,553.45 

MWG Apparel Corporation 7,275.45 

River City Industrial Products 8,171.69 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 7,833.54 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 9,383.00 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 8,247.90 

Unisync Group Ltd. 8,840.73 

Vallen Canada 8,041.69 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 13,007.40 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 7 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section G  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 7,908.00 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 11,292.00 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 10,008.00 

Hazmasters Inc. 7,605.60 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 8,013.60 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 9,084.00 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 15,108.00 

MWG Apparel Corporation 9,600.00 

River City Industrial Products 8,985.60 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 8,025.60 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 18,917.50 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 8,988.00 

Unisync Group Ltd. 11,644.80 

Vallen Canada 8,347.20 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 14,392.25 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 8 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section H  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 
2,020.00 

(partial bid) 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 2,886.00 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 2,831.50 

Hazmasters Inc. No bid submitted 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 
2,422.70 

(partial bid) 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 2,803.50 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 4,755.75 

MWG Apparel Corporation 
2,460.00 

(partial bid) 

River City Industrial Products 2,735.15 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 2,637.30 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 5,250.00 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 2,775.00 

Unisync Group Ltd. 2,982.70 

Vallen Canada 2,707.55 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 4,597.00 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 9 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section I  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 3,377.00 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 6,760.00 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 6,619.00 

Hazmasters Inc. No bid submitted 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 6,086.30 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 6,576.50 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 9,995.00 

MWG Apparel Corporation 5,000.00 

River City Industrial Products 6,341.70 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 6,177.60 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 10,712.50 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 6,500.00 

Unisync Group Ltd. 6,959.80 

Vallen Canada 6,341.70 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 10,260.50 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 10 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section J  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 4,548.25 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 6,496.35 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 116,303.80 

Hazmasters Inc. 4,374.60 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 4,608.05 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 5,169.25 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 8,619.25 

MWG Apparel Corporation 5,520.00 

River City Industrial Products 5,054.25 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 4,616.10 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 7,330.00 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 5,169.25 

Unisync Group Ltd. 6,693.00 

Vallen Canada 4,802.40 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 6,970.75 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 11 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section K  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 12,416.80 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing No bid submitted 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 39,139.00 

Hazmasters Inc. No bid submitted 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 35,360.80 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 40,103.50 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 58,641.50 

MWG Apparel Corporation 15,045.00 

River City Industrial Products No bid submitted 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 36,576.50 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 36,560.00 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. No bid submitted 

Unisync Group Ltd. 39,391.10 

Vallen Canada 39,011.70 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 40,890.00 
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Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

UNEVALUATED 
POSTED OPENING 

RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 
 

Page 12 of 12  

367-2020  

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF PROTECTIVE CLOTHING  

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm.  August 20, 2020  

 
 BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE 

Section L  

ABC Fire & Safety Equipment Ltd. 1,978.20 

Acuity/ProForma Marketing 3,109.32 

Corporate Security Supply Ltd. 2,761.20 

Hazmasters Inc. 1,902.96 

Levitt-Safety Ltd. 2,004.48 

MacMor Industries Ltd. 2,266.20 

McCarthy Uniforms Inc. 3,958.20 

MWG Apparel Corporation 2,403.00 

River City Industrial Products 2,192.76 

Source Atlantic Ltd. 2,007.72 

The Uniform Experts North America Inc. 3,576.50 

Tough Workwear – S&S Sportswear Ltd. 2,248.20 

Unisync Group Ltd. 3,198.60 

Vallen Canada 2,088.36 

Winnipeg Stitch Factory (Pine Falls Clothing) 4,055.90 

 
 


