



DESCRIPTION: Provision of Tree Planting and Maintenance Services

Submission Deadline: 4:00pm March 20th, 2013

BIDDER	ALTERNATIVE 1	ALTERNATIVE 2
SHURWOOD FOREST	TOTAL: No Bid	SECTION A: No Bid
		SECTION B: No Bid
		SECTION C: 144,000.00
		SECTION D: 108,000.00
SHELMERDINE LTD.	TOTAL: 1,076,525.00	SECTION A: 63,775.00
		SECTION B: 189,000.00
		SECTION C: 515,625.00
		SECTION D: 391,375.00
2958172 MANITOBA LTD. O/A J&K ZINN LANDSCAPE CONTRACTORS LTD.	TOTAL: 484,825.00	SECTION A: 52,525.00
		SECTION B: 120,075.00
		SECTION C: 237,375.00
		SECTION D: 186,000.00
J ROSS PROPERTY MAINTENANCE & LANDSCAPING LTD.	TOTAL: 344,030.00	SECTION A: 24,430.00
		SECTION B: 67,975.00
		SECTION C: 146,750.00
		SECTION D: 104,875.00
ALLIANCE TREE CARE INC.	TOTAL: 636,275.00	SECTION A: No Bid
		SECTION B: 136,000.00
		SECTION C: 262,000.00
		SECTION D: 197,500.00
GREEN DROP LTD.	TOTAL: 413,900.00	SECTION A: No Bid
		SECTION B: 103,000.00
		SECTION C: 183,250.00
		SECTION D: 127,500.00
GREEN BROTHERS INC.	TOTAL: 314,985.00	SECTION A: 26,025.00
		SECTION B: 67,500.00
		SECTION C: 125,750.00
		SECTION D: 58,500.00
B&B LANDSCAPE & CARTAGE INC.	TOTAL: 398,697.50	SECTION A: 40,120.00
		SECTION B: 94,400.00
		SECTION C: 0.00
		SECTION D: 118,525.00