@ UNEVALUATED

Corporate Finance Department

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 401-2011

TN . o POSTED OPENING
Wmnlpeg Materials Management Division RESULTS Page 1o0of1
DESCRIPTION: REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF SANDBAGS FROM VARIOUS LOCATIONS
Submission 4:00 p.m. May 13, 2011
Deadline:
BIDDER BID PRICE BID PRICE

Award as a Whole

Award by Section

DOUG PANCHUK

Section A 205,326.26

DBA: SHURWOOD FOREST 431,098.26 Section B 270,327.58
] Section A 295,834.00
T & A TRUCKING No Bid Section B No Bid
Section A 297,310.00
WINNIPEG ENVIRONMENTAL REMEDIATIONS INC. 688,740.00 Section B 391.430.00
Section A 263,005.00
WINTEC BUILDING SERVICES No Bid Section B 331,210.00
) Section A 292,736.00
GREEN BROTHERS INC. No Bid Section B 415,518.00
Section A 331,615.00
GREENCUT ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES 703,186.00 Section B 424.551.00
Section A 282,088.00
ROGERS SEWER AND WATER LTD. 652,428.40 Section B 370.340.40
) Section A 445,965.00
D & D EXCAVATING AND HAULING LTD. No Bid Section B 587.145.00
Section A 325,897.50
5726841 MANITOBA INC. 715,177.02 Section B 383.842.28
Section A 210,404.00

MULDER CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS LTD. 423,231.00

Section B 249,913.00




