

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

COMPACT SIZED AUTOMOBILES

	PRICES SHOWN do not include		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
	P.S.T.	or G.S.T	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km
Item (1) DAILY RATE			35.88	0.00	nb	nb	32.00	0.08	nb	nb	38.99	0.00
Item (2) WEEKLY RATE			209.88	0.00	nb	nb	187.00	0.08	nb	nb	229.99	0.00
Item (3) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS			688.88	0.00	1,190.00	0.10	675.00	0.08	nb	nb	729.99	0.00
Item (4) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS			588.88	0.00	945.00	0.10	619.00	0.08	nb	nb	699.99	0.00
Legend nb=no bid												
PAGE (1) OF 28												

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

MID-SIZED AUTOMOBILES

	PRICES SHOWN do not include P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.				
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km			
Item (5) DAILY RATE	36.88		0.00	nb		nb	34.00		0.08	nb		nb	39.99		0.00
Item (6) WEEKLY RATE	219.88		0.00	nb		nb	200.00		0.08	nb		nb	239.99		0.00
Item (7) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	789.88		0.00	1,290.00		0.10	760.00		0.08	nb		nb	824.99		0.00
Item (8) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	689.88		0.00	1,045.00		0.10	690.00		0.08	nb		nb	799.99		0.00
Legend nb=no bid															
PAGE (2) OF 28															

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

FULL SIZED AUTOMOBILES

	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.						
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km			
Item (9) DAILY RATE	37.88		0.00	nb		nb	35.00		0.08	nb		nb	41.99		0.00
Item (10) WEEKLY RATE	234.88		0.00	nb		nb	219.00		0.08	nb		nb	249.99		0.00
Item (11) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	838.88		0.00	1,360.00		0.10	805.00		0.08	nb		nb	869.99		0.00
Item (12) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	738.88		0.00	1,145.00		0.10	745.00		0.08	nb		nb	849.99		0.00
Legend nb=no bid															
PAGE (3) OF 28															

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

MINI PASSENGER VAN

	PRICES SHOWN do not include P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.				
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km			
Item (13) DAILY RATE	47.88		0.00	nb		nb	41.00		0.08	nb		nb	51.99		0.00
Item (14) WEEKLY RATE	328.88		0.00	nb		nb	229.00		0.08	nb		nb	369.99		0.00
Item (15) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	1,088.88		0.00	1,400.00		0.10	825.00		0.08	nb		nb	1,299.99		0.00
Item (16) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	988.88		0.00	1,295.00		0.10	745.00		0.08	nb		nb	1,279.99		0.00
Legend nb=no bid															
PAGE (4) OF 28															

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

1/2 TON CARGO VAN

	PRICES SHOWN do not include P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.		
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	
Item (17) DAILY RATE	52.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb		nb	55.99	0.00
Item (18) WEEKLY RATE	329.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb		nb	359.99	0.00
Item (19) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	898.88		0.00	1,125.00		0.10	nb		nb		nb	934.99	0.00
Item (20) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	798.88		0.00	1,050.00		0.10	nb		nb		nb	919.99	0.00
Legend nb=no bid													
PAGE (5) OF 28													

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

8-PASSENGER VAN

	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.		
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch
Item (21) DAILY RATE	nb		nb		100.00	0.15	nb		nb		nb
Item (22) WEEKLY RATE	nb		nb		675.00	0.15	nb		nb		nb
Item (23) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	nb		nb		2,700.00	0.15	nb		nb		nb
Item (24) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	nb		nb		2,600.00	0.15	nb		nb		nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (6) OF 28											

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

MID-SIZED SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD

	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km
Item (25) DAILY RATE	54.88	0.00	nb	nb	47.00	0.08	nb	nb	59.99	0.00
Item (26) WEEKLY RATE	338.88	0.00	nb	nb	275.00	0.08	nb	nb	359.99	0.00
Item (27) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	1,288.88	0.00	1,475.00	0.10	975.00	0.08	nb	nb	1,339.99	0.00
Item (28) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	1,188.88	0.00	1,250.00	0.10	925.00	0.08	nb	nb	1,319.99	0.00
Legend nb=no bid										
PAGE (7) OF 28										

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

FULL SIZED SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD

	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km
Item (29) DAILY RATE	94.88	0.00	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (30) WEEKLY RATE	549.88	0.00	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (31) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	1,598.88	0.00	1,595.00	0.10	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (32) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	1,498.88	0.00	1,350.00	0.10	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid										
PAGE (8) OF 28										

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
		\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km
Item (33) DAILY RATE		44.88	0.00	nb	nb	35.00	0.08	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (34) WEEKLY RATE		244.88	0.00	nb	nb	225.00	0.08	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (35) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS		874.88	0.00	nb	nb	866.00	0.08	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (36) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS		774.88	0.00	nb	nb	766.00	0.08	nb	nb	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (9) OF 28											

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km
Item (37) DAILY RATE	44.88	0.00	nb	nb	35.00	0.08	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (38) WEEKLY RATE	244.88	0.00	nb	nb	225.00	0.08	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (39) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	874.88	0.00	1,185.00	0.10	866.00	0.08	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (40) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	774.88	0.00	995.00	0.10	766.00	0.08	nb	nb	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid										
PAGE (10) OF 28										

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD

	PRICES SHOWN do not include P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.				
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km			
Item (41) DAILY RATE	99.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb	49.00		0.10	nb		nb
Item (42) WEEKLY RATE	599.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb	294.00		0.10	nb		nb
Item (43) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	2,288.88		0.00	1,185.00		0.10	nb		nb	1,063.00		0.08	nb		nb
Item (44) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	2,188.88		0.00	995.00		0.10	nb		nb	930.00		0.08	nb		nb
Legend nb=no bid															
PAGE (11) OF 28															

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

	PRICES SHOWN do not include P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.			
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km		
Item (45) DAILY RATE	99.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb		nb	nb		
Item (46) WEEKLY RATE	599.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb		nb	nb		
Item (47) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	2,288.88		0.00	1,295.00		0.10	nb		nb		1,126.43	0.10	nb	nb
Item (48) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	2,188.88		0.00	1,175.00		0.10	nb		nb		994.06	0.10	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid														
PAGE (12) OF 28														

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

3/4 TON PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD

	PRICES SHOWN do not include P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.		
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ / km	
Item (49) DAILY RATE	99.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		72.85		0.10	109.99	0.00
Item (50) WEEKLY RATE	599.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		437.10		0.10	629.99	0.00
Item (51) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	2,288.88		0.00	1,295.00		0.10	nb		1,214.00		0.08	2,339.99	0.00
Item (52) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	2,188.88		0.00	1,175.00		0.10	nb		1,079.00		0.08	2,319.99	0.00
Legend nb=no bid													
PAGE (13) OF 28													

**BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008**

3/4 TON PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

	PRICES SHOWN do not include P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km
Item (53) DAILY RATE	99.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb	78.34		0.10
Item (54) WEEKLY RATE	599.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb	470.05		0.10
Item (55) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	2,288.88		0.00	1,295.00		0.10	nb		nb	1,343.00		0.08
Item (56) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	2,188.88		0.00	1,175.00		0.10	nb		nb	1,204.00		0.08
Legend nb=no bid												
PAGE (14) OF 28												

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1/2 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.				
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km			
Item (57) DAILY RATE	49.88		0.00	nb		nb	45.00		0.08	59.00		0.10	53.99		0.00
Item (58) WEEKLY RATE	319.88		0.00	nb		nb	269.00		0.08	357.00		0.10	344.99		0.00
Item (59) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	984.88		0.00	1,295.00		0.10	968.00		0.08	1,250.00		0.10	1,199.99		0.00
Item (60) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	884.88		0.00	1,175.00		0.10	868.00		0.08	1,052.00		0.10	1,179.99		0.00
Legend nb=no bid															
PAGE (15) OF 28															

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1/2 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km
Item (61) DAILY RATE	49.88	0.00	nb	nb	45.00	0.08	59.00	0.10	53.99	0.00
Item (62) WEEKLY RATE	319.88	0.00	nb	nb	269.00	0.08	356.00	0.10	344.99	0.00
Item (63) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	984.88	0.00	1,295.00	0.10	968.00	0.08	1,246.00	0.08	1,199.99	0.00
Item (64) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	884.88	0.00	1,175.00	0.10	868.00	0.08	1,106.00	0.08	1,179.99	0.00
Legend nb=no bid										
PAGE (16) OF 28										

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

3/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
		\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km
Item (65) DAILY RATE		99.88	0.00	nb	nb	nb	nb	76.00	0.10	nb	nb
Item (66) WEEKLY RATE		599.88	0.00	nb	nb	nb	nb	460.00	0.10	nb	nb
Item (67) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS		2,288.88	0.00	1,575.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,317.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (68) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS		2,188.88	0.00	1,375.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,177.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (17) OF 28											

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

3/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
		\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km
Item (69) DAILY RATE		99.88	0.00	nb	nb	nb	nb	82.00	0.10	nb	nb
Item (70) WEEKLY RATE		599.88	0.00	nb	nb	nb	nb	492.00	0.10	nb	nb
Item (71) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS		2,288.88	0.00	1,575.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,442.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (72) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS		2,188.88	0.00	1,375.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,302.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (18) OF 28											

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1/2 TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD

	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km
Item (73) DAILY RATE	54.88	0.00	nb	nb	45.00	0.08	55.00	0.10	nb	nb
Item (74) WEEKLY RATE	348.88	0.00	nb	nb	269.00	0.08	330.00	0.01	nb	nb
Item (75) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	1,029.88	0.00	1,375.00	0.10	968.00	0.08	1,146.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (76) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	929.88	0.00	1,200.00	0.10	868.00	0.08	1,006.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid										
PAGE (19) OF 28										

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1/2 TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km	\$ Std	Ch / km
Item (77) DAILY RATE	49.88	0.00	nb	nb	45.00	0.08	62.50	0.10	nb	nb
Item (78) WEEKLY RATE	319.88	0.00	nb	nb	269.00	0.08	375.00	0.10	nb	nb
Item (79) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	984.88	0.00	1,375.00	0.10	968.00	0.08	1,294.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (80) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	884.88	0.00	1,160.00	0.10	868.00	0.08	1,154.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid										
PAGE (20) OF 28										

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

3/4 TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T		Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.				
	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std	Ch	\$ / km			
Item (81) DAILY RATE	99.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb	77.00		0.10	109.99		0.00
Item (82) WEEKLY RATE	599.88		0.00	nb		nb	nb		nb	466.00		0.10	629.99		0.00
Item (83) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS	2,288.88		0.00	1,595.00		0.10	nb		nb	1,373.00		0.08	2,339.99		0.00
Item (84) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS	2,188.88		0.00	1,475.00		0.10	nb		nb	1,233.00		0.08	2,319.99		0.00
Legend nb=no bid															
PAGE (21) OF 28															

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1-TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
		\$ Std Ch	\$/km	\$ Std Ch	\$/ km	\$ Std Ch	\$/ km	\$ Std Ch	\$/ km	\$ Std Ch	\$/ km
Item (93) DAILY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	85.00	0.10	nb	nb
Item (94) WEEKLY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	510.00	0.10	nb	nb
Item (95) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS		2,588.88	0.00	1,750.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,624.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (96) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS		2,488.88	0.00	1,450.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,484.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (24) OF 28											

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1-TON, 2WD STAKE BODY TRUCK - REGULAR OR EXTENDED CAB

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
		\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km
Item (97) DAILY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (98) WEEKLY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (99) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS		nb	nb	1,570.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,372.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (100) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS		nb	nb	1,200.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,232.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (25) OF 28											

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

1-TON, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCK - REGULAR OR EXTENDED CAB

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
		\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km
Item (101) DAILY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (102) WEEKLY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (103) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS		nb	nb	1,675.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,432.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (104) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS		nb	nb	1,380.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,392.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (26) OF 28											

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

14,000# GVWR, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCK - CREW CAB

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
		\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km
Item (105) DAILY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (106) WEEKLY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (107) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS		nb	nb	2,300.00	0.10	nb	nb	2,068.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (108) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS		nb	nb	2,100.00	0.10	nb	nb	1,928.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (27) OF 28											

BID RESULTS
TENDER 852-2008

14,000# GVWR, 4WD DUMP BODY TRUCK - CREW CAB

	PRICES SHOWN <u>do not include</u> P.S.T. or G.S.T	Enterprise Rent-A-Car		The Driving Force Inc. (Driving Force).		Eastern Chrysler Dodge Jeep		Calmont Leasing Ltd.		National Car Rental (Canada) Inc.	
		\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km	\$ Std Ch	\$ / km
Item (109) DAILY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (110) WEEKLY RATE		nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb	nb
Item (111) 1 MONTH <u>to less than</u> 6 MONTHS		nb	nb	2,300.00	0.10	nb	nb	2,246.00	0.08	nb	nb
Item (112) 6 MONTHS <u>to less than</u> 12 MONTHS		nb	nb	2,100.00	0.10	nb	nb	2,106.00	0.08	nb	nb
Legend nb=no bid											
PAGE (28) OF 28											